
What Did the New America Need? Topics of
the Constitutional Convention
In the sweltering summer of 1787, delegates from across the fledgling
United States gathered in Philadelphia, their mission to address the glaring
inadequacies of the Articles of Confederation and forge a new framework
for a cohesive nation. The Constitutional Convention would become a
pivotal moment in American history, a crucible where the foundational
principles of the country were debated, shaped, and ultimately enshrined in
the Constitution.

From Confederation to Constitution: Addressing the Flaws of the
Articles

The Articles of Confederation, adopted in 1781, had served as a loose
framework for governing the newly independent states. However, it soon
became apparent that the Articles were insufficient to meet the challenges
of a growing and increasingly complex society. The central government
was weak, lacking the authority to tax, regulate commerce, or enforce laws.
As a result, the nation faced financial instability, economic stagnation, and
a lack of unity among the states.
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The delegates recognized the urgent need to strengthen the central
government while preserving the principles of individual liberty and states'
rights. The Articles of Confederation had granted excessive power to the
states, leading to disharmony and inefficiency. The Convention aimed to
strike a delicate balance, creating a federal government with sufficient
authority to address national concerns while respecting the autonomy of
the states.

The Critical Issues Debated at the Convention

The delegates to the Constitutional Convention grappled with a host of
critical issues, each representing a fundamental question about the nature
of the new nation.

1. The Structure of the Government

One of the most contentious debates centered on the structure of the
government itself. Some delegates, such as James Madison, favored a
strong central government with limited powers for the states. Others, like
Patrick Henry, were staunch advocates of states' rights and sought to
minimize the federal government's authority.

The delegates ultimately devised a three-branch system of government,
with separate powers for the legislative, executive, and judicial branches.
This innovative structure ensured that no one branch could become too
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powerful and that the government would be accountable to the people
through the system of checks and balances.

2. Representation: The Great Compromise

Another critical issue was how to fairly represent the states in the new
government. Larger states, such as Virginia, argued for representation
based on population, giving them a greater voice in Congress. Smaller
states, like Delaware, countered that each state deserved equal
representation, regardless of size.

The Great Compromise, brokered by Roger Sherman and Oliver Ellsworth,
resolved this impasse. It created a bicameral legislature, with a Senate
where each state had equal representation and a House of
Representatives based on population. This compromise ensured that both
large and small states had a voice in the government.

3. Slavery: A Divisive Issue

The issue of slavery cast a long shadow over the Convention. Southern
states, heavily dependent on slave labor, demanded constitutional
protections for their "peculiar institution." Northern delegates, led by
Benjamin Franklin and Gouverneur Morris, condemned slavery as a moral
abomination.

The delegates reached a deeply flawed compromise that allowed the
continuation of slavery while prohibiting its expansion into new territories.
This compromise masked the deep divisions over slavery that would
eventually tear the nation apart.



In addition to these key issues, the delegates debated a wide range of
other topics, including taxation, foreign relations, and the nature of
citizenship. Each debate shaped the contours of the new nation, reflecting
the diverse opinions and aspirations of the delegates.

The Ratification Process: Securing the Constitution

Once the Constitution was drafted, it faced a new challenge: ratification by
the states. Nine out of the thirteen states needed to approve the
Constitution for it to become law. Supporters of the Constitution, known as
Federalists, argued that it was a necessary framework for a strong and
prosperous nation.

Opponents, known as Anti-Federalists, raised concerns about the
Constitution's lack of a bill of rights and the potential for tyranny by the
federal government. They feared that the Constitution would erode the
power of the states and endanger individual liberties.

After a hard-fought campaign, the Federalists prevailed. The Constitution
was ratified in 1788, ushering in a new era in American history.

The Constitutional Convention of 1787 was a defining moment in the birth
of the United States. The delegates confronted a host of critical issues,
from the structure of the government to the contentious question of slavery.
Through rigorous debates and compromises, they forged a Constitution
that has endured as a testament to their wisdom and foresight.

The Constitution, with its system of checks and balances, federalism, and
individual rights, has served as a model for democratic governments



around the world. It is a living document, amended over the years to reflect
the changing needs and aspirations of the American people.

As we reflect on the legacy of the Constitutional Convention, let us
remember the courage and determination of the delegates who shaped the
destiny of our nation. Their debates and compromises have left an
enduring imprint on American history, reminding us that the principles of
democracy are always worth defending.
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