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In the realm of the Six Duchies, where ancient magic lingers in the air and
the forces of darkness never truly slumber, a young woman named
Nighteyes embarks on a perilous journey that will forever alter the destiny
of her world.

Orphaned at a tender age, Nighteyes has spent her life as an outcast,
shunned by her peers for her mysterious abilities. But when a chance
encounter with a enigmatic stranger reveals the truth about her lineage,
she is thrust into a world of danger and intrigue.

Guided by her newfound mentor, the enigmatic FitzChivalry Farseer,
Nighteyes begins to unravel the secrets of her past. She discovers that she
is the last descendant of a powerful line of sorcerers, and that her destiny is
intertwined with the fate of the Six Duchies. As she delves deeper into the
mysteries of her heritage, Nighteyes uncovers a web of treachery and
deceit that threatens to consume her.

With each step she takes, Nighteyes faces perilous challenges and
formidable foes. She must confront her own inner demons and embrace
the wild magic that flows through her veins. Along the way, she forms
unlikely alliances and finds solace in the love of those who believe in her.
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But as the forces of darkness gather, Nighteyes must make a choice that
will shape the destiny of her world. Will she succumb to the darkness or will
she rise to meet the challenge and become the hero that her people need?

Begone the Raggedy Witches is a captivating tale of magic, adventure, and
self-discovery. Robin Hobb weaves a rich and immersive world, filled with
complex characters, intricate world-building, and heart-pounding action.
This is a story that will stay with you long after you finish reading it.

About the Author

Robin Hobb is the New York Times bestselling author of the Farseer
Trilogy, the Liveship Traders Trilogy, the Tawny Man Trilogy, and the Rain
Wild Chronicles. Her books have won numerous awards, including the
Nebula Award and the Locus Award. She lives in Washington state with her
husband.

Reviews

"Begone the Raggedy Witches is a masterpiece of fantasy storytelling.
Robin Hobb has created a world that is both enchanting and terrifying, and
her characters are unforgettable. This is a book that will stay with you long
after you finish reading it." - George R.R. Martin

"Robin Hobb is one of the greatest fantasy writers of our time. Begone the
Raggedy Witches is a must-read for fans of the genre." - Brandon
Sanderson

"Begone the Raggedy Witches is a captivating tale of magic, adventure,
and self-discovery. Robin Hobb has woven a rich and immersive world,



filled with complex characters, intricate world-building, and heart-pounding
action." - Publishers Weekly

Order Your Copy Today

Begone the Raggedy Witches is available in hardcover, paperback, and
ebook formats. Order your copy today and begin your journey into the
realm of the Six Duchies.
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